

PLAINTIFF'S EXHIBIT 1

In The Case Of

Michael Reid, Individually and on Behalf of All Others Similarly Situated,

v.

I.C. System, Inc.,

2:12-cv-2661 ROS

**KAZEROUNI LAW GROUP, APC
245 FISCHER AVENUE, UNIT D1
COSTA MESA, CA 92626
(800) 400-6808**

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

Hyde & Swigart	\$125,260.50
David J. McGlothlin, ATTORNEY (AT \$395.00 per hr.)	
<i>November 26, 2013</i>	
Drafted Motion to Amend and First Amended Complaint	2.00 hrs.
Sent FAC and Motion to JBS/AK for review	0.10 hrs.
<i>May 20, 2014</i>	
Reviewed Attorney Fee Motion	0.90 hrs.
<i>May 26, 2014</i>	
Conducted research re Oppo	1.80 hrs.
<i>June 2, 2014</i>	
Finalized and filed Oppo	3.60 hrs.
<i>September 19, 2014</i>	
Drafted and propounded discovery	1.40 hrs.
<i>October 1, 2014</i>	
Drafted Stip for more time re Disco plan	0.80 hrs.
<i>October 3, 2014</i>	
Received approval re stip. Filed stip	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 10, 2014</i>	
Prepared and filed Status Report	0.90 hrs.
<i>November 5, 2014</i>	
Review court's order. Discuss discvoery dispute with co-counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>November 7, 2014</i>	
Review discovery produced. Sampling 2000 accounts	2.20 hrs.
<i>November 18, 2014</i>	
Conf call with co-counsel discuss case strategy, docs produced, discovery disputes	1.70 hrs.
<i>November 19, 2014</i>	
Prepare task memo for case strategy, assign tasks between attys	1.00 hrs.
<i>November 20, 2014</i>	
Confer with OC and co-counsel, draft and circulate Joint Proposed Scheduling Order	1.70 hrs.
<i>November 24, 2014</i>	
Review motion for reconsideration	0.60 hrs.
Review Courts scheduling order, calendar dates	0.10 hrs.
<i>November 26, 2014</i>	
Review Court order	0.10 hrs.
<i>December 1, 2014</i>	
Correspondence with Flynn re: Hansen deposition	0.20 hrs.
<i>December 2, 2014</i>	
Emails concerning Hansen deposition	0.20 hrs.
<i>December 4, 2014</i>	
Review court order	0.10 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>December 5, 2014</i>	Review court order	0.10 hrs.
<i>December 9, 2014</i>	Review produced records in preparation for deposition. Thousands of pages.	8.00 hrs.
<i>December 10, 2014</i>	Continued review of 2000 sample accounts, search for code TDNC WN	5.50 hrs.
<i>December 12, 2014</i>	Review email correspondence from OC and Co-counsel	0.10 hrs.
	Discussion with Loker and Taylor, review each other's results of file sample searches	3.10 hrs.
<i>December 15, 2014</i>	Review of Avaya dialer information, prepare for possible Avaya deposition	2.20 hrs.
	Review court notice- Pro Hac of Klutho, check credentials	0.50 hrs.
<i>December 16, 2014</i>	Prepare Reid memo regarding case strategy prior to disc cut off. Discuss case with co-counsel	1.50 hrs.
<i>December 17, 2014</i>	confer with JBS, then conf call with all co-counsel regarding discovery disputes, and possible mediation	1.00 hrs.
	Drafted settlement letter to try to get us into mediation	0.70 hrs.
<i>December 24, 2014</i>	Discussions and Correspondence with co-counsel and OC Klutho about mediation.	1.00 hrs.
<i>December 28, 2014</i>	Discussions and Correspondence with co-counsel and OC Klutho about mediation.	1.00 hrs.
	Discussion with co-course, moving forward with depositions	0.70 hrs.
<i>December 29, 2014</i>	Prep for Expert deposition	4.80 hrs.
	Further discussions and Correspondence with co-counsel and OC Klutho about mediators	0.80 hrs.
<i>December 30, 2014</i>	Travel to expert deposition	2.50 hrs.
	Attend and defend expert deposition	2.20 hrs.
	Travel back from expert deposition, review file for documents requested during deposition, while travelling	3.00 hrs.
<i>December 31, 2014</i>	Discussions with co-counsel re: D's supplemental disclosures, expert depo, litigation strategy, mediation	2.20 hrs.
<i>January 6, 2015</i>	Review changes to Bacon deposition	1.00 hrs.
<i>January 12, 2015</i>	Calls to proposed mediators, checking schedules and logistics	1.50 hrs.
<i>January 15, 2015</i>	Set up private mediation	2.00 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

Prepare stipulation to stay case	0.50 hrs.
<i>January 20, 2015</i>	
Discussion and correspondence with OC Klutho about informal discovery of class size	0.70 hrs.
<i>February 10, 2015</i>	
Mediation prep	1.50 hrs.
<i>February 11, 2015</i>	
Travel to mediation location, review informal numbers and expert analysis	2.50 hrs.
Meeting with all Plaintiff's counsel. Mediation prep strategy, run numbers	6.00 hrs.
<i>February 12, 2015</i>	
Attend private mediation in LA	7.00 hrs.
Travel back from mediation	2.50 hrs.
<i>February 17, 2015</i>	
Draft joint status report	0.50 hrs.
<i>February 18, 2015</i>	
Discussions with co-counsel on settlement strategy	1.70 hrs.
<i>February 19, 2015</i>	
Finalize joint status report and file	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 25, 2015</i>	
Research insurance liability, bad faith, stipulated judgments, discuss with co-counsel	4.20 hrs.
<i>July 15, 2015</i>	
Reviewed Ds Status Report	0.20 hrs.
<i>July 16, 2015</i>	
Drafted and filed status report	0.70 hrs.
<i>July 28, 2015</i>	
Research re Ds Motion	3.90 hrs.
<i>July 29, 2015</i>	
Worked on Oppo	1.60 hrs.
<i>July 30, 2015</i>	
Worked on Oppo	4.20 hrs.
<i>July 31, 2015</i>	
Finalized and filed Oppo	2.90 hrs.
<i>November 7, 2015</i>	
Prepare for mediation	3.00 hrs.
<i>November 9, 2015</i>	
Travel to LA, attend, and travel back from mediation	14.00 hrs.
<i>March 31, 2016</i>	
Review Courts order denying class settlement	0.40 hrs.
<i>April 4, 2016</i>	
Draft settlement demand, discuss with co-counsel, send to OC Flynn	0.50 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>April 18, 2016</i>	Draft stip for settlement conference, incorporate JBS and Flynn revisions, file with the Court.	0.40 hrs.
<i>April 26, 2016</i>	Called Judge Fine's chambers on 4/26. and left another message giving her my cell phone	0.10 hrs.
<i>May 18, 2016</i>	5/18. Mediation set for 6/20. Need to send in brief on 6/3.	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 19, 2016</i>	Prep for mediation, review all relevant materials and discovery, travel to Flagstaff	4.00 hrs.
<i>June 20, 2016</i>	Attend mediation conference with Judge Fine	8.50 hrs.
	Travel from mediation	2.20 hrs.
<i>July 25, 2016</i>	Reviewed Ds Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement	0.80 hrs.
<i>August 29, 2016</i>	Worked on finalizing motion, settlement agreement. Call with OC Flynn (.3)	6.00 hrs.
<i>March 27, 2017</i>	Reviewed order, discuss with co-counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>April 3, 2017</i>	conf call with co-counsel to discuss	0.20 hrs.
<i>April 13, 2017</i>	Diacuss case with co-counsel- supplemental filing	0.50 hrs.
<i>April 14, 2017</i>	Review filing, arrange for courtesy copy to be sent to the judge	0.20 hrs.
<i>June 29, 2017</i>	Review Court order on preliminary approval, discuss with co-counsel	0.60 hrs.
<i>June 30, 2017</i>	Email Loker regarding Court order, offer assistance.	0.20 hrs.
<i>July 3, 2017</i>	Discuss case with Loker	0.20 hrs.
	Review email exchange with OC	0.20 hrs.
<i>July 5, 2017</i>	Discuss case with Loker. Develop position on Judge's questions.	0.80 hrs.
<i>July 6, 2017</i>	Conf call with co-counsel regarding Judge's 6/28 order, and changes proposed to Defendant	0.40 hrs.
	Call with OC regarding joint filing	0.40 hrs.
	Review and research concerns in Court's order (1), and issues raised on call. Revise Joint report (1hr), revise supporting exhibits (.6)	2.60 hrs.
<i>July 17, 2017</i>	Discuss with co-counsel the contact from AG regarding settlement. Email them back to set up a call.	0.40 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>August 3, 2017</i>	Email from AG, review supplemental docs, exchange emails with OC Flynn. Discuss case with co-counsel	1.60 hrs.
<i>August 4, 2017</i>	Review new banner ads, discuss claims process with Dahl. They have proposal for reverse email look-up.	1.40 hrs.
<i>August 7, 2017</i>	Meetings with co-counsel (JBS & ML) on reverse-email look-up issue. Research problems, get started on supplemental filing.	1.60 hrs.
<i>August 8, 2017</i>	Telephonic meetings with claims, and co counsel to discuss notice plan, email searches. Conf call with OC on issues.	2.00 hrs.
	Draft Supplemental Report to file with Court. Respond to OC's email with a list of issues to discuss. Meet with co-counsel, develop case strategy, respond to OC.	2.20 hrs.
<i>August 28, 2017</i>	Email from A.G. with further questions. Emails and discussions with co-counsel	0.50 hrs.
<i>August 30, 2017</i>	Another email from state AG. Email to defense counsel with proposed answers to questions.	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 1, 2017</i>	Follow-up email to Flynn.	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 6, 2017</i>	Emails to AG and Flynn	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 21, 2017</i>	Email regarding EMail Notice.	0.20 hrs.
	David J. McGlothlin, In Summary:	<u>\$60,487.00</u> <u>163.40 hrs.</u>
Joshua B. Swigart, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)		
<i>February 20, 2013</i>	Conducted research re Judgment on Pleadings and made notes for Oppo	5.20 hrs.
<i>August 20, 2014</i>	Received Offer of Judgment. Reviewed Complaint and conducted research re allegations	2.80 hrs.
<i>February 9, 2015</i>	Prep re mediation	2.40 hrs.
<i>February 11, 2015</i>	Further prep re mediation. Legal research as well as research re preliminary approval motions in AZ	3.40 hrs.
<i>February 12, 2015</i>	Conf. call re mediation	1.00 hrs.
	Attend Mediation	7.00 hrs.
	Travel to SD following mediation	2.90 hrs.
<i>April 9, 2015</i>	Emails re settlement	0.30 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

Review MOU	1.00 hrs.
<i>June 26, 2015</i>	
Worked on preliminary approval motion	3.90 hrs.
<i>July 24, 2015</i>	
Researched and edited oppo re Motion to Enforce	5.70 hrs.
<i>November 2, 2015</i>	
Mediation on 11/9 at 9a in LA	0.10 hrs.
<i>November 9, 2015</i>	
Mediation and travel	14.00 hrs.
<i>November 12, 2015</i>	
Emails from and to Monica about the status of settlement of the class case	0.10 hrs.
<i>December 14, 2015</i>	
Conf. call re settlement papers and preliminary approval motion	0.50 hrs.
<i>December 16, 2015</i>	
Review stip and email to Monica	0.50 hrs.
<i>December 28, 2015</i>	
Conf. call re Reid SA issues	0.50 hrs.
<i>March 31, 2016</i>	
Review Court order denying motion for preliminary approval	0.30 hrs.
<i>April 4, 2016</i>	
Review demand letter to Flynn	0.10 hrs.
<i>April 13, 2016</i>	
Review AK internal memo	0.30 hrs.
<i>April 14, 2016</i>	
Call to Flynn re proposed plan of allocation	0.10 hrs.
Email co-counsel results of call with Flynn re plan of allocation	0.10 hrs.
Review stipulation	0.10 hrs.
<i>April 16, 2016</i>	
Order approving counsel to have until 4/18 to determine if Plaintiffs will file for preliminary approval	0.10 hrs.
<i>April 18, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with co-counsel re settlement positions	0.50 hrs.
Call Flynn. Left a message	0.10 hrs.
Call with Flynn - ok on the stip. DJM to circualate	0.30 hrs.
Conf. call with co-counsel	0.50 hrs.
Call to Flynn; left message	0.10 hrs.
Review stipulation for settlement conf. before the Magistrate Judge	0.10 hrs.
<i>May 5, 2016</i>	
Review status conf. hearing order set for 6/20 at 10a in Flagstaff; ED to update calendar	0.10 hrs.
Settlement conf. Appears all parties and insurance companies have to appear. Brief due on 6/8, Send a hard copy as a courtesy	0.10 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>May 10, 2016</i>	
Review settlement conf. statements from each party	0.50 hrs.
Review additional briefing on Reid	0.30 hrs.
<i>May 19, 2016</i>	
Ds request for telephonic appearance at settlement conf.	0.10 hrs.
<i>May 25, 2016</i>	
Review order denying request for D to appear telephonically	0.10 hrs.
Receive modified settlement conf. memo from court; DJM to review dates	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 1, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with DJM re prior to conf. with Sean	0.30 hrs.
Conf. call with Sean Flynn re settlement conf. issues	0.60 hrs.
<i>June 11, 2016</i>	
Ds settlement conf. statement	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 13, 2016</i>	
Continued prep re mediation. Researched various ways to address issues identified in Judge Silver's Orders	4.70 hrs.
<i>June 14, 2016</i>	
Receive settlement matrix for TCPA	0.10 hrs.
Conf. call with DJM re settlement conf	0.50 hrs.
Prepare for settlement conf.	3.00 hrs.
<i>June 15, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with Dahl administrators	0.50 hrs.
Review claims administration estimates for notice on the 900K	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 19, 2016</i>	
Travel to mediation	5.00 hrs.
Pre mediation meeting	2.00 hrs.
<i>June 20, 2016</i>	
Pre mediation meeting with class counsel	2.00 hrs.
Attend court facilitated mediation	8.50 hrs.
Travel from mediation	6.00 hrs.
Email to Flynn re need to discuss plan of allocation issues	0.10 hrs.
Email Dahl administration re costs of notice	0.10 hrs.
Emails from client evidencing ICS records are wrong	0.10 hrs.
Revised SA from DJM and mediation notes	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 21, 2016</i>	
Return call to Jeff Dahl class administration; no increased costs on different claim forms	0.10 hrs.
<i>June 22, 2016</i>	
Letter from Flynn re settlement terms; review and confer with team	0.50 hrs.
Draft response letter to Flynn and circulate to our team	0.10 hrs.
Email and mail letter to Flynn rejecting his offer	0.10 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>June 27, 2016</i>	
Email from Flynn re settlement letter and respond	0.10 hrs.
Email exchange from Flynn	0.10 hrs.
More emails with Flynn	0.10 hrs.
<i>July 8, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with claims admin	0.50 hrs.
Review claims decs and forms from Dahl	2.00 hrs.
<i>July 22, 2016</i>	
Order allowing settlement docs filed by 8/8	0.10 hrs.
<i>July 26, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with Dahl re claim form and claim process; see notes	0.30 hrs.
<i>July 28, 2016</i>	
Review supplemental notice decs from Dahl	0.10 hrs.
<i>August 2, 2016</i>	
Conf. call with new counsel John on settlement	0.50 hrs.
<i>August 4, 2016</i>	
Updated preliminary approval motion from ML	0.10 hrs.
<i>August 22, 2016</i>	
Updated Third Preliminary Approval Motion	4.90 hrs.
<i>August 23, 2016</i>	
Revised SA from Flynn; David/ML to review	0.10 hrs.
<i>August 30, 2016</i>	
New motion for preliminary approval filed	0.10 hrs.
<i>April 3, 2017</i>	
Conf. call to discuss filing of supplemental notice and timing	0.20 hrs.
<i>April 10, 2017</i>	
Review redlines to court required documents	0.20 hrs.
<i>July 20, 2017</i>	
Conf call with David re prep for AG call Friday	0.50 hrs.
Prep for AG call	0.80 hrs.
<i>July 26, 2017</i>	
call with AGs	0.60 hrs.
Call with DJM re AG discussion	0.50 hrs.
Review draft of joint status report	0.20 hrs.
Review revisions to long form notice and claim form	0.30 hrs.
<i>July 31, 2017</i>	
Conf call re claims process and data handlin	0.50 hrs.
<i>January 3, 2018</i>	
Conf call with David re notice; email notice got miss handled by the claims admin. We will need to go into court and have the dates extended	0.40 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

January 18, 2018

Research and edit fee petition 2.10 hrs.

January 19, 2018

Discussed administration with Dahl 0.70 hrs.

Joshua B. Swigart, In Summary: \$64,444.50 105.90 hrs.

Matt Loker, ATTORNEY (AT \$505.00 per hr.)*July 26, 2017*

0.20 hrs.

Matt Loker, In Summary: \$95.00 0.20 hrs.

Krysti A. Ruddle, CLERK (AT \$125.00 per hr.)*September 2, 2014*

Received Response to RFPD 0.10 hrs.

January 6, 2015

Received Original Depo of Jeffrey Allan Hansen 0.10 hrs.

January 22, 2015

Received Notice of Scheduled Mediation from Judicate West for 2/12/15 10am at 11601 Wilshire Blvd Suite 2040 West LA, CA 90025 0.10 hrs.

June 23, 2015

Received Confidential Telephonic Deposition of Tom Emms (with cd) 0.10 hrs.

Krysti A. Ruddle, In Summary: \$50.00 0.40 hrs.

Front Desk, FRONT DESK (AT \$125.00 per hr.)*May 30, 2014*

Soft File Created 0.00 hrs.

April 15, 2015

mailed confirm, Srogs & notice of taking depo. to attys michael kltho & sean flynn 0.10 hrs.

July 22, 2015

Scanned/mailed telephonic Depo. to DJM & AK 0.10 hrs.

July 21, 2016

Scanned original receipts into client file. placed in today's scan box 0.10 hrs.

August 30, 2016

GSO mailed ltr w/ New motion for preliminary approval attached 0.10 hrs.

Front Desk, In Summary: \$50.00 0.40 hrs.

Melissa Hurtado, PARALEGAL (AT \$150.00 per hr.)*June 25, 2014*

mailed M&C ltr to OC 0.10 hrs.

Melissa Hurtado, In Summary: \$15.00 0.10 hrs.

, (AT per hr.)*November 18, 2015*

Review joint stip for preliminary approval 0.20 hrs.

, In Summary: \$119.00 0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

Kaz LG	\$127,038.50
Abbas Kazerounian, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)	
<i>February 11, 2013</i>	
Finalized and filed Oppo re Ex Parte	2.90 hrs.
<i>February 14, 2013</i>	
Reviewed Ds Reply re Ex Parte	0.80 hrs.
<i>February 26, 2013</i>	
Worked on Oppo	4.10 hrs.
<i>February 28, 2013</i>	
Continued work on oppo	1.20 hrs.
<i>March 4, 2013</i>	
Finalized and filed Oppo	3.30 hrs.
<i>July 29, 2013</i>	
Began Class Cert Motion	4.60 hrs.
<i>July 31, 2013</i>	
Continued work on Class Cert Motion	2.90 hrs.
<i>August 2, 2013</i>	
Finalized and filed Class Cert	5.80 hrs.
<i>October 21, 2013</i>	
Conducted legal research in relation to pleadings	0.60 hrs.
<i>October 28, 2013</i>	
Began Motion for Leave to Amend	1.10 hrs.
<i>October 31, 2013</i>	
Finalized and filed Motion for Leave	1.70 hrs.
<i>November 20, 2013</i>	
Conducted research re Oppo	1.90 hrs.
<i>November 21, 2013</i>	
Worked on Reply	2.30 hrs.
<i>November 25, 2013</i>	
Finalized and filed Reply	3.70 hrs.
<i>February 12, 2015</i>	
Attend Mediation	7.00 hrs.
<i>November 9, 2015</i>	
Attend mediation	8.20 hrs.
<i>January 19, 2016</i>	
Finalized and filed 2nd prelim approval	5.30 hrs.
<i>April 18, 2016</i>	
Conf call with co counsel re settlement and certifiability - planned strategy	0.50 hrs.
<i>August 24, 2016</i>	
Worked on 3rd preliminary approval motion	4.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

August 29, 2016

Finalized and filed preliminary approval motion 2.90 hrs.

Abbas Kazerounian, In Summary: \$40,605.00 65.00 hrs.

David J. McGlothlin, ATTORNEY (AT \$395.00 per hr.)*May 30, 2014*

Continued work on Oppo 1.10 hrs.

June 4, 2014

Reviewed Amended Scheduling Order 0.20 hrs.

October 31, 2014

Prepared and filed non oppo 0.20 hrs.

David J. McGlothlin, In Summary: \$592.50 1.50 hrs.

Emily Beecham, ATTORNEY (AT \$225.00 per hr.)*November 14, 2017*

Received voice message from Mark Anthony re filing a claim; fwd to ML & DM 0.20 hrs.

Emily Beecham, In Summary: \$45.00 0.20 hrs.

Joshua B. Swigart, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)*February 12, 2015*

Travel to mediation 2.70 hrs.

January 14, 2016

Edited Second Preliminary Approval Motion 4.10 hrs.

Joshua B. Swigart, In Summary: \$4,250.00 6.80 hrs.

Matt Loker, ATTORNEY (AT \$505.00 per hr.)*September 25, 2012*

Met with Vaccaro re calls from a debt collector that he is receiving. Discussed situation with him and any connection he may have with the original creditor 0.70 hrs.

September 26, 2012

Conducted research re legal issues and IC System 2.10 hrs.

September 27, 2012

Began Complaint 0.30 hrs.

September 28, 2012

Finalized and filed Complaint for Vaccaro 0.90 hrs.

October 10, 2012

Discussed case with Vaccaro 0.20 hrs.

November 20, 2012

ICS filed an answer. Reviewed to see what ¶s are admitted as well as affirmative defenses 0.30 hrs.

November 27, 2012

ENE set for 1/15/13 0.20 hrs.

November 30, 2012

Call with Vaccaro re ENE 0.20 hrs.

January 11, 2013

Call with Vaccaro re ENE 0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>January 15, 2013</i>	
Prepared for ENE	0.30 hrs.
Attended ENE	0.30 hrs.
<i>January 18, 2013</i>	
Call with Vacarro	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 1, 2013</i>	
D filed Motion for Judgment on Pleadings	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 4, 2013</i>	
Reviewed Ds JoP and made notes for Oppo	1.80 hrs.
<i>February 5, 2013</i>	
D filed Ex Parte protective order. Reviewed and made notes for Oppo	0.60 hrs.
<i>February 7, 2013</i>	
Worked on ex parte oppo	3.10 hrs.
<i>February 22, 2013</i>	
Reviewed Order re Ex Parte	0.20 hrs.
<i>March 1, 2013</i>	
Edited Oppo	0.80 hrs.
<i>March 11, 2013</i>	
Made notes re Ds Reply	1.20 hrs.
<i>April 17, 2013</i>	
D filed Notice of Related case. Looked into other case	0.60 hrs.
<i>November 5, 2013</i>	
Discussed case status with Vacarro	0.40 hrs.
<i>November 18, 2013</i>	
Reviewed Ds Oppo	0.20 hrs.
<i>November 22, 2013</i>	
Continued work on Reply	1.80 hrs.
<i>December 27, 2013</i>	
Reviewed Ds status report	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 10, 2014</i>	
Order re Status Conference	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 13, 2014</i>	
Attended Status Conf	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 13, 2014</i>	
Discussed status with Vacarro	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 17, 2014</i>	
Drafted Status Report	0.90 hrs.
<i>February 24, 2014</i>	
Reviewed Status Conf Order	0.20 hrs.
<i>May 19, 2014</i>	
Attended Status Conf	0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>May 21, 2014</i>	Drafted Joint Motion to Dismiss	0.20 hrs.
<i>May 27, 2014</i>	Received approval to file Joint Dismissal	0.20 hrs.
	Filed Joint Dismissal	0.20 hrs.
<i>June 30, 2014</i>	Finalized and filed prelim approval motion	4.70 hrs.
<i>July 9, 2014</i>	Reviewed preliminary approval order	0.80 hrs.
<i>August 18, 2014</i>	Prepared Pro Hac App	0.90 hrs.
	Received Order granting Pro Hac	0.20 hrs.
<i>August 29, 2014</i>	Reviewed Order re Disco dispute	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 8, 2014</i>	Reviewed Ds disco dispute papers	0.60 hrs.
<i>September 9, 2014</i>	Began response re disco dispute	2.10 hrs.
<i>September 10, 2014</i>	Finalized and filed response	1.20 hrs.
<i>September 17, 2014</i>	Reviewed Ds filings re disco dispute	0.80 hrs.
<i>September 18, 2014</i>	Reviewed Court Order re dispute	0.40 hrs.
<i>October 6, 2014</i>	Reviewed order re stip	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 8, 2014</i>	Reviewed cost order	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 10, 2014</i>	Finalized and filed Motion to Dismiss Vacarro	1.90 hrs.
<i>October 15, 2014</i>	Reviewed order re sampling	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 31, 2014</i>	Reviewed Ds Ex parte	0.60 hrs.
<i>November 6, 2014</i>	Began dismissal re vacarro	0.80 hrs.
<i>November 18, 2014</i>	Reviewed sampling docs	2.40 hrs.
<i>February 12, 2015</i>	Travel to mediation	3.10 hrs.
	Attend Mediation	7.00 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>February 13, 2015</i>	
Return to SLO following mediation	5.10 hrs.
<i>June 18, 2015</i>	
Began drafting preliminary approval motion	3.10 hrs.
<i>June 19, 2015</i>	
Continued work on preliminary approval motion	3.30 hrs.
<i>June 23, 2015</i>	
Edited preliminary approval motion	2.90 hrs.
<i>August 3, 2015</i>	
Worked on Class Cert Motion	4.50 hrs.
<i>August 4, 2015</i>	
Continued work on class cert motion	6.20 hrs.
<i>August 5, 2015</i>	
Finalized and filed class cert motion	2.70 hrs.
<i>August 12, 2015</i>	
Reviewed Ds Ex Oarte	0.70 hrs.
<i>August 13, 2015</i>	
Prepared oppo re ex parte	1.30 hrs.
<i>August 14, 2015</i>	
Finalized and filed oppo	2.70 hrs.
<i>August 25, 2015</i>	
Reviewed Oppo and made notes for reply	2.20 hrs.
<i>September 3, 2015</i>	
Prepared and filed Motion to Seal	4.70 hrs.
<i>September 28, 2015</i>	
Made notes re Class Cert Oppo	1.10 hrs.
<i>October 2, 2015</i>	
Worked on Reply	3.20 hrs.
<i>October 5, 2015</i>	
Continued work on Reply	3.40 hrs.
<i>October 7, 2015</i>	
Edited Reply	1.40 hrs.
<i>October 8, 2015</i>	
Finalized and filed Reply	4.20 hrs.
<i>November 9, 2015</i>	
Attend Mediation	8.20 hrs.
<i>January 11, 2016</i>	
Continued work on P&A re Preliminary Approval	3.10 hrs.
Reviewed SPF comments re Settlement Agreement and edited	1.90 hrs.
Discussed ILYM Dec with Elizabeth and prepared draft.	0.60 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

<i>January 14, 2016</i>	
Researched Flynn's issue re retroactivity. Concluded that there was no issue	2.10 hrs.
Reviewed Flynn's edits to P&A and Settlement Agreement - updated said docs	1.70 hrs.
<i>January 15, 2016</i>	
Spoke with JBS re Claim Forms	0.30 hrs.
Edited claim forms based upon conversation with JBS	1.80 hrs.
<i>January 18, 2016</i>	
Reviewed SPF's changes to the Settlement Agreement	0.20 hrs.
Spoke with DJM re changes made by SPF	0.10 hrs.
Updated Settlement Agreement and sent redlined version back to SPF	0.40 hrs.
Reviewed SPF's comments re Settlement Agreement then circulated final draft	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 19, 2016</i>	
Downloaded courtesy copies and arranged for them to be sent to Judge Silver	0.30 hrs.
<i>January 21, 2016</i>	
Conference call with Flynn re "issues."	0.70 hrs.
Edited P&A based upon Flynn's changes and circulated a draft with those changes incorporated	1.10 hrs.
<i>January 22, 2016</i>	
DM Requested Oral with Judge Silver	0.10 hrs.
<i>April 20, 2016</i>	
Order assigning judge fine to mediate	0.20 hrs.
<i>June 19, 2016</i>	
Travel to AZ for mediation	2.40 hrs.
<i>June 20, 2016</i>	
Attend mediation with Judge Fine. Had to depart prior to conclusion to catch flight	6.30 hrs.
Fly to SLO following mediation in AZ	2.90 hrs.
<i>September 30, 2016</i>	
Conducted research re Oppo	3.60 hrs.
<i>January 8, 2017</i>	
Updated client re case. Still waiting for order	0.20 hrs.
<i>March 26, 2017</i>	
Reviewed Order Granting Prelim Approval	0.40 hrs.
<i>April 10, 2017</i>	
Reviewed preliminary approval order	0.30 hrs.
Prepared supp filing	0.80 hrs.
Sent supp filing to Sean for approval	0.20 hrs.
Asked co-counsel if they had any changes to Supp filing	0.20 hrs.
Spoke with David re Supp Filing	0.20 hrs.
Edited Long Form notice	0.90 hrs.
Confirmed opt out address with Mark	0.20 hrs.
Updated supp filing	0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

Sent supp filing to Sean	0.20 hrs.
<i>April 12, 2017</i>	
Reviewed ICS edits to Supp Filing. Made additional changes	0.90 hrs.
<i>April 13, 2017</i>	
Sean made additional notes. Reviewed and updated	0.30 hrs.
<i>July 4, 2017</i>	
Worked on Joint Preliminary Schedule	0.40 hrs.
<i>July 5, 2017</i>	
Discussed Joint filing with David	0.80 hrs.
Updated Joint Filing	0.30 hrs.
Sent Joint Filing to Sean for review	0.10 hrs.
<i>July 6, 2017</i>	
Call with Flynn re Joint Filing	0.40 hrs.
<i>July 11, 2017</i>	
Followed up with Flynn re Joint filing	0.20 hrs.
Received approval from Flynn re joint filing	0.20 hrs.
<i>August 10, 2017</i>	
Reviewed Dahl dec - proposed an addition	0.20 hrs.
<i>August 11, 2017</i>	
Edited joint filing with Flynn and filed	0.60 hrs.
<i>December 8, 2017</i>	
Reviewed Press Notice	0.20 hrs.
Reviewed email notice	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 3, 2018</i>	
Worked on fee petition	2.10 hrs.
<i>January 5, 2018</i>	
Discussed notice progress with Dahl	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 9, 2018</i>	
Reviewed notice docs	0.20 hrs.
Followed up with Dahl re notice. Seems certain documents were not sent out	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 11, 2018</i>	
Compared notices with ECF filings	0.40 hrs.
<i>January 12, 2018</i>	
Continued work on fee petition	4.10 hrs.
<i>January 16, 2018</i>	
Edited fee petition	0.70 hrs.
<i>January 18, 2018</i>	
Continued work on Fee Petition	3.10 hrs.
Worked on fee petition	4.40 hrs.
Discussed supplemental notice with Dahl	0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Reid v. I.C. System, Inc. }

January 19, 2018

Finalized and filed fee petition	5.10 hrs.
Prepared stip to extend time	0.80 hrs.

Matt Loker, In Summary:	<u>\$81,546.00</u>	<u>168.80 hrs.</u>
-------------------------	--------------------	--------------------

Total Fees (For The Entire Firm): \$252,299.00